



Salzmann Hughes, P.C
 79 St Paul Drive
 Chambersburg, PA 17201
 Phone: 717-263-2121

Invoice submitted to:

Huntington Township
 750 Trolley Road
 York Springs, Pennsylvania 17372

Invoice # : 61606

Invoice Date :	3/31/2026
Terms :	Net 30

Date	By	Service Summary	Hours/Qty	Rate	Amount
In Reference To: <u>General</u>					
3/2/2026	tking	Meeting with Judge Campbell to discuss auditor vacancy	0.60	\$169.00	\$101.40
3/2/2026	tking	Email to Julie with outcome of meeting with Judge	0.30	\$169.00	\$50.70
3/2/2026	tking	Prepared legal notice to put Judge's Order in paper for hearing	0.50	\$169.00	\$84.50
3/3/2026	tking	Call with Julie to discuss various questions	0.70	\$169.00	\$118.30
3/3/2026	tking	Research on public comment and decorum policies and sent samples for review	0.30	\$169.00	\$50.70
3/4/2026	tking	Review legal ad proofs for supervisor pay ordinance and auditor vacancy; emails with Julie on public comment policy and where it might be found	0.30	\$169.00	\$50.70
3/5/2026	tking	Email discussion with Scott and Julie re: refund request from Carl Leach	0.30	\$169.00	\$50.70
3/9/2026	tking	Call with Julie to go over two potential agenda items for upcoming meeting	0.50	\$169.00	\$84.50
3/9/2026	tking	Review emails for reference to resolution book; review email from insurance company related to Tyrone truck	0.30	\$169.00	\$50.70
3/9/2026	bcarter	rev insurance provisions for Tyrone Truck; email TAK	0.50	\$169.00	\$84.50
3/12/2026	tking	Call with Julie to discuss items for meeting	0.40	\$169.00	\$67.60
3/12/2026	tking	Attend monthly meeting	1.50	\$169.00	\$253.50
3/12/2026	tking	Email correspondence from Andrew Merkel on SALDO adoption; email response on getting signed copy to him and County	0.20	\$169.00	\$33.80
3/16/2026	tking	Call with Julie to discuss how to handle garbage contract	0.30	\$169.00	\$50.70
3/18/2026	tking	Email update from the Judge on potential auditor candidates and forward conversation to Julie	0.30	\$169.00	\$50.70
3/18/2026	tking	Prepared letters to auditor candidates advising them they must attend hearing based on Judge's comments since Order is not explicitly clear	0.60	\$169.00	\$101.40
3/18/2026	tking	Prepared letter to Mr. Bupp as chair of vacancy board about Judge's comment on attending hearing	0.40	\$169.00	\$67.60
3/19/2026	tking	Call with Julie to discuss update on auditor candidates	0.20	\$169.00	\$33.80

PAID
 CK. NO. 17197
 DATE 4-23-26

PAID
 CK. NO. 17197
 DATE 4-14-26

3/19/2026	tking	Email to Judge's secretary regarding auditor candidates attending meeting; email back to Julie with response	0.20	\$169.00	\$33.80
3/25/2026	tking	Prepared exhibits and documents for hearing; went over petition; attend Court hearing	0.90	\$169.00	\$152.10
3/25/2026	tking	Call with Julie re: auditor hearing and various other matters	0.50	\$169.00	\$84.50
3/25/2026	tking	Received court order from Judge's secretary; email to auditors and Township; prepared letters to serve court Order as well via mail	0.60	\$169.00	\$101.40
3/26/2026	tking	Put signed SALDO together with all appendices and sent to County and Township	0.40	\$169.00	\$67.60
3/26/2026	tking	Call with Julie re: auditor appointment	0.20	\$169.00	\$33.80
3/27/2026	tking	Emails from Scott and Andrew Merkel on data center ordinance; started reviewing sample ordinance from other Townships	0.30	\$169.00	\$50.70
3/31/2026	bcarter	discuss next meeting of board of supervisors; watch video of special meeting	0.40	\$169.00	\$67.60
3/31/2026	tking	Call with Julie to discuss who will prepare fee refund policy and items for agenda	0.40	\$169.00	\$67.60
Fees Subtotal			12.10		\$2,044.90
				Total	\$2,044.90
				Previous Balance	\$1,921.80
3/16/2026	Payment #17168				-\$1,921.80
				Payments & Credits	-\$1,921.80
				Balance Due	\$2,044.90

Please remit payment to the address above or go to our website at www.salzmannhughes.com and select Online Invoice Payment.



Salzmann Hughes, P.C.
79 St Paul Drive
Chambersburg, PA 17201
Phone: 717-263-2121

Invoice submitted to:

Huntington Township
750 Trolley Road
York Springs, Pennsylvania 17372

Invoice # : 61607

Invoice Date :	3/31/2026
Terms :	Net 30

Date	By	Service Summary	Hours/Qty	Rate	Amount
In Reference To: Right to Know Requests					
3/3/2026	tking	Email response to questions related to RTK request	0.30	\$169.00	\$50.70
3/5/2026	mbell	Res re possible redactions from resume; email corresp w/ TAK re same	0.50	\$169.00	\$84.50
3/5/2026	tking	Request to EMB to provide information on what is allowed to be redacted from certain documents subject to request	0.30	\$169.00	\$50.70
3/16/2026	tking	Review and discuss information subject to redaction for DiGangi RTK	0.30	\$169.00	\$50.70
3/17/2026	tking	Review February bills for DiGangi RTK for any potential redactions	0.30	\$169.00	\$50.70
3/19/2026	tking	Call with Julie to discuss DiGangi RTK on previous RTK requests where she is requesting RTK responses she already has	0.30	\$169.00	\$50.70
Fees Subtotal			2.00		\$338.00
				Total	\$338.00
				Previous Balance	\$1,014.00
3/16/2026 Payment #17168					-\$1,014.00
					Payments & Credits - \$1,014.00
					Balance Due \$338.00

Please remit payment to the address above or go to our website at www.salzmannhughes.com and select Online Invoice Payment.